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In 2008 and 2009, the United States Congress apologized for the "fundamental injustice, cruelty, brutality,
and inhumanity of slavery." Today no one denies the cruelty of slavery, but few issues inspired more
controversy in the eighteenth and nineteenth centuries. Abolitionists denounced the inhumanity of slavery,
while proslavery activists proclaimed it both just and humane. Margaret Abruzzo delves deeply into the
slavery debate to better understand the nature and development of humanitarianism and how the slavery
issue helped shape modern concepts of human responsibility for the suffering of others.

Abruzzo first traces the slow, indirect growth in the eighteenth century of moral objections to slavery's
cruelty, which took root in awareness of the moral danger of inflicting unnecessary pain. Rather than accept
pain as inescapable, as had earlier generations, people fought to ease, discredit, and abolish it. Within a
century, this new humanitarian sensibility had made immoral the wanton infliction of pain.

Abruzzo next examines how this modern understanding of humanity and pain played out in the slavery
debate. Drawing on shared moral-philosophical concepts, particularly sympathy and benevolence, pro- and
antislavery writers voiced starkly opposing views of humaneness. Both sides constructed their moral
identities by demonstrating their own humanity and criticizing the other’s insensitivity.

Understanding this contest over the meaning of humanity?and its ability to serve varied, even contradictory
purposes?illuminates the role of pain in morality. Polemical Pain shows how the debate over slavery’s
cruelty played a large, unrecognized role in shaping moral categories that remain pertinent today.
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From reader reviews:

Kathleen Land:

What do you concerning book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man? If
you don't have spare time to do others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have
free time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They must answer that question because
just their can do which. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is correct. Because
start from on pre-school until university need that Polemical Pain: Slavery, Cruelty, and the Rise of
Humanitarianism (New Studies in American Intellectual and Cultural History) to read.

Howard Martinez:

Now a day people who Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each details they get. How a lot more to
be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Looking at a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information especially this Polemical Pain: Slavery, Cruelty, and
the Rise of Humanitarianism (New Studies in American Intellectual and Cultural History) book because
book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred per-cent guarantees
there is no doubt in it as you know.

Jeannette Coleman:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only
find publication that need more time to be study. Polemical Pain: Slavery, Cruelty, and the Rise of
Humanitarianism (New Studies in American Intellectual and Cultural History) can be your answer given it
can be read by you who have those short spare time problems.

Malcolm Moser:

Book is one of source of information. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students and also native
or citizen need book to know the change information of year for you to year. As we know those textbooks
have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. With the book
Polemical Pain: Slavery, Cruelty, and the Rise of Humanitarianism (New Studies in American Intellectual
and Cultural History) we can consider more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? For being
creative person must prefer to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that acceptable with your aim.
Don't end up being doubt to change your life with this book Polemical Pain: Slavery, Cruelty, and the Rise of
Humanitarianism (New Studies in American Intellectual and Cultural History). You can more appealing than
now.
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