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The forgotten classic that launched the career of one of America's greatest playwrights

It took more than fifty years for The Man Who Had All the Luck to be appreciated for what it truly is: the first
stirrings of a genius that would go on to blossom in such masterpieces as Death of a Salesman and The
Crucible. Infused with the moral malaise of the Depression era, the parable-like drama centers on David
Beeves, a man whose every obstacle to personal and professional success seems to crumble before him with
ease. But his good fortune merely serves to reveal the tragedies of those around him in greater relief, offering
what David believes to be evidence of a capricious god or, worse, a godless, arbitrary universe. David’s
journey toward fulfillment becomes a nightmare of existential doubts, a desperate grasp for reason in a
cosmos seemingly devoid of any, and a struggle that will take him to the brink of madness. This Penguin
Classics edition includes an introduction by Christopher Bigsby.

For more than seventy years, Penguin has been the leading publisher of classic literature in the English-
speaking world. With more than 1,700 titles, Penguin Classics represents a global bookshelf of the best
works throughout history and across genres and disciplines. Readers trust the series to provide authoritative
texts enhanced by introductions and notes by distinguished scholars and contemporary authors, as well as
up-to-date translations by award-winning translators.
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From reader reviews:

Kenneth Roberts:

Book is actually written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can realize everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important factor to bring us around the world.
Close to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A publication The Man Who Had All the Luck
(Penguin Classics) will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know
about every little thing. But some of you think that open or reading the book make you bored. It is not make
you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you looking for best book or acceptable book with you?

Sheree Gonzalez:

The publication with title The Man Who Had All the Luck (Penguin Classics) has lot of information that you
can find out it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This particular book exist new know-how the
information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world currently. That is important
to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the
globalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Betsy Haley:

The book untitled The Man Who Had All the Luck (Penguin Classics) contain a lot of information on the
idea. The writer explains your ex idea with easy means. The language is very simple to implement all the
people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read this. The book was authored by famous author. The
author brings you in the new time of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can continue
reading your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime. In a situation
you wish to purchase the e-book, you can start their official web-site and order it. Have a nice examine.

Tammie Torres:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our information for everything. By a publication we can
know everything we really wish for. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet.
Every year ended up being exactly added. This reserve The Man Who Had All the Luck (Penguin Classics)
was filled in relation to science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your research
competence. Some people has various feel when they reading the book. If you know how big good thing
about a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get
book that you simply wanted.
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